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NO. 13-237 

C.D. Various 

BOARD OF RECREATION AND PARK COMMISSIONERS 

SUBJECT: VARIOUS COMMUNICATIONS 

Approved / Disapproved ___ _ 

The following communications have been received by the Board and recommended action 
thereon is presented. 

From: 

1) Mayor, relative to a proposed 
Amendment to the Contract with Mobile 
Illumination, Inc., for Winter Themed 
Exterior lighting and Decor at Pershing 
Square. 

2) City Controller, relative to the 
Department's internal audits. 

3) Councilmember LaBonge, two 
communications, relative to Beachwood 
Drive and the Hollywood sign. 

4) City Clerk, relative to a five-year 
restoration plan for the Department. 

5) City Clerk, relative to naming the 
new campground in Hansen Dam as 
"Otis Wallace Memorial Campground." 

Recommendation: 

Referred to staff for further processing. 

Referred to General Manager. 

Referred to General Manager. 

Referred to General Manager. 

Referred to General Manager. 
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6) City Clerk, relative to funding for 
Summer Night Lights 2013. 

7) City Clerk, relative to the regular 
meeting schedule for the Council's 
Standing Committees. 

8) City Clerk, relative to funding for 
increased park maintenance and services 
at pools in Council District 3. 

9) City Clerk, relative to funding for 
drainage improvements at Fern Dell in 
Griffith Park. 

10) City Clerk, relative to the 2013-
2014 Personnel Authority. 

11) Chief Legislative Analyst, 
forwarding the Legislative Report for the 
weeks ending July 12, July 19, July 26, 
and August 2, 2013. 

12) Courtney Smith, 
research on Griffith Park. 

conducting 

13) Suzan Rood Wilson, two 
communications relative to the Lease of 
Camp High Sierra to Mammoth 
Mountain Ski Area, LLC. 

14) Paul Schidmit, relative to staff at the 
Los Angeles Center for Enriched Studies 
Pool. 

15) Michael Jantzen, relative to Stair­
Scape structures. 

16) Debra Mindlin, relative to plants 
available to the Department. 
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Referred to General Manager. 

Note and File. 

Referred to General Manager. 

Note and File. 

Note and File. 

Note and File. 

Referred to General Manager. 

Referred to General Manager. 

Referred to General Manager. 

Referred to General Manager. 

Referred to General Manager. 
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17) Chris. relative to issues with the 
sports activities at Mar Vista Recreation 
Center. 

18) Daniel T. Reza, Principal, Reza & 
Associates, relative to a proposed 
monument sign for Solano Canyon. 

19) Tim Donovan, West Los Angeles 
Citizens' Coalition, to United States 
Federal Judge Hon. Dana M. Sabraw, 
relative to allegations against Rob 
Dyrdek. 

20) Nadine D. Parkos, President, Venice 
Heritage Foundation, relative to a 
proposed Venice History Museum. 

21) Anonymous, relative to Department 
management. 
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Referred to General Manager. 

Referred to General Manager. 

Note and File. 

Referred to General Manager. 

Note and File. 

This report was prepared by Paul Liles, Clerk Typist, Commission Office. 




